OPERATIONS COMMITTEE

APRIL 17, 2003

SUBJECT:
GREEN, GOLD AND RED LINE RAIL VEHICLE PARTS 

ACTION: 
AWARD CONTRACT FOR RAIL VEHICLE PARTS 

RECOMMENDATION

Authorize the Chief Executive Officer to award a firm fixed price contract under Bid 03-0011 to the lowest responsive, responsible bidders to provide Green, Gold and Red Line vehicle parts for a total price of $578,585, inclusive of sales tax to the following:

A. Siemens Transportation Systems, Inc., for friction brake and coupler light rail equipment for a total amount not to exceed $201,566.

B. WABCO Transit Division, for friction brake and coupler light rail equipment for a total amount not to exceed $377,019.

C
Find that MTA received one bid each for air comfort system equipment, line items 40 through 42, for heavy rail cars.  Under Public Utilities Code section 130232, the bid has been rejected and the vehicle parts may be purchased at a lower price on the open market.  

D.
The Board hereby authorizes the purchase of air comfort system equipment pursuant to Public Utilities Code section 130233. (Requires two-thirds vote)

RATIONALE

This Inventory Management procurement is a one-time purchase for various rail parts for the Red, Green and Gold Line cars in order to provide continued support and safe operating conditions for these rail fleet vehicles.  The IFB did not include any parts for Blue Line cars because at the time the IFB was issued there were no parts necessary that exceeded the threshold for Board approval.  This is not a requirements type contract where parts are ordered as the need arises.  These parts will be set up in inventory so that they are available for Rail Operations to be able to replace a failed part immediately and thus prevent a rail car from being out of service for a protracted length of time.  These parts have very long lead times, from six to eight months; therefore, it is necessary to have these items either in stock or ready for delivery to ensure uninterrupted revenue service.

Staff is seeking approval to purchase the Metro Red Line air comfort system parts, items 40-42, in the open market.  Under Public Utility Code Section 130233, the law gives the MTA the right to make a business decision to reject bids and purchase supplies, equipment, or materials at a lower price in the open market.  In the case of the heavy rail air comfort system parts, staff found that it is in the agency’s best interest to save in excess of $164,000 by purchasing these three parts in the open market.   In the open market process, staff can place an order and purchase the parts directly from the supplier with the lowest price, in this case the original equipment manufacturer (OEM).  

FINANCIAL IMPACT

Funding of $578,585 for these parts will be included in the FY 04 budget and subsequent budgets in Cost Center Number 3940, Rail Equipment Maintenance under Project 300007, Light Rail Purchase Parts and Project Number 300009 Heavy Rail Purchase Parts.  Since this is a multi-year contract, the cost center manager and Executive Officer will be accountable for budgeting the cost in future years.
ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

The alternative is not to purchase the rail parts.  Staff does not recommend this action.  The parts are required and necessary for the continued operation of the rail fleet.     

ATTACHMENTS

A
Procurement Summary


A-1
Procurement History


A-2
Bid Tabulation

Prepared By:
Gerald Francis, Rail General Manager



Dave Kubicek, Director Rail Services



Sherri Jackson, Senior Buyer

	

	John B. Catoe, Jr.

Deputy Chief Executive Officer

	

	Roger Snoble

Chief Executive Officer


BOARD REPORT ATTACHMENT A

PROCUREMENT SUMMARY 

GREEN, GOLD AND RED LINE RAIL PARTS

	1.
	Contract Number:  03-0011

	2.
	Recommended Vendor:

Siemens Transportation Systems, Inc., Sacramento, California
WABCO Transit Division, Duncan, South Carolina

	 3.
	Cost/Price Analysis Information:

	
	1. Bid/Proposed Price:

$201,566 –Siemens Transportation

$377,019 –WABCO Transit
	Estimated Amount:

$2,915,000

	
	B. Details of Significant Variances are in Attachment A-1.D

	4.
	Contract Type:  Fixed Price

	5.
	Procurement Dates: 

	
	A.  Issued:  10/30/02

	
	B.  Advertised:  10/15/02

	
	C.  Pre-bid Conference: 11/13/02

	
	D. Proposals/Bids Due: 1/17/03

	
	E. Pre-Qualification Completed:  Yes

	
	F. Conflict of Interest Form Submitted to Ethics:  Yes

	6.
	Small Business Participation: 

	
	A.  Bid/Proposal Goal:

No goal recommended
	Date Small Business Evaluation Completed:

N/A

	
	Small Business Commitment:  No goal recommended



	7.
	Invitation for Bid/Request for Proposal Data:

	
	Notifications Sent:

115
	Bids/Proposals Picked up:

14
	Bids/Proposals Received:

3

	8.
	Evaluation Information:

	
	A. Bidders/Proposers Names:

1.  Siemens Transportation Systems, 

Inc.

2.  WABCO Transit Division

3.  Knorr Brake Corporation


	Bid/Proposal Amount:

$4,410,382.12

$516,819.06

$74,043.00
	Best and Final Offer Amount:  N/A



	
	B. Evaluation Methodology:  Selection of the lowest responsive, responsible bidder.

	9.
	Protest Information: 

	
	A.  Protest Period End Date:  04/24/03

	
	B.  Protest Receipt Date:  TBD

	
	C.  Disposition of Protest Date:  TBD

	10
	Contract Administrator: Sherri Jackson
	Telephone Number: 213/922-1025

	11
	Project Manager:

Jim Montoya
	Telephone Number: 

213/922-5092


BOARD REPORT ATTACHMENT A-1

PROCUREMENT HISTORY

GREEN, GOLD AND RED LINE RAIL PARTS

A.  
Background on Contractor

Siemens Transportation Systems, Inc. is a division of the Siemens organization, which has a history spanning more than 150 years.  Siemens has grown from a small workshop into a highly successful global company.  Siemens Transportation Systems is a world-leading systems house in the rail industry.  Siemens is the world's largest supplier of products, systems, solutions and services for industrial automation.  Siemens is the Original Equipment Manufacturer of the Green Line rail cars. 
WABCO Transit Division is a division of Wabtec, one of North America's largest, most comprehensive suppliers of products, services and systems for the global rail industry. Wabtec provides products and services to virtually every major intercity passenger transit system in North America. Intercity and metro cars, commuter cars and light rail vehicles are all supplied with an integrated series of components.  Wabtec Corporation was formed in November 1999 when Westinghouse Air Brake Company merged with MotivePower Industries, Inc.  The original Westinghouse Air Brake was founded in 1869.  In the past WABCO has provided satisfactory service and parts. 

WABCO and Siemens have provided satisfactory service and products to the MTA.

B.   
Procurement Background
In accordance with the MTA’s Procurement Policies and Procedures, staff performed a technical evaluation of the three bids that were received.  The bids submitted by Siemens Transportation Systems, Inc., WABCO Transit Division, and Knorr Brake Corporation were found to be in full compliance with the specifications. 

The Diversity and Economic Opportunity Department did not recommend a Disadvantaged Business Enterprise (DBE) participation goal for this procurement.

C.  
Evaluation Criteria
Technical review and selection of the lowest responsive, responsible bidder.

Bidder #1
Siemens Transportation Systems, Inc. was found compliant with the specification, and the lowest bidder for items 27, 35 and 37.  Siemens was the single bidder on items 1-10, 12-14, 16-19, 22, 23, 29, 32 and 36.  At this time, no recommendation to award is being made for these items

pending further review of the requirements.  However, on items 40-42,

staff determined that the parts could be purchased for less on the open market based on written quote from the OEM; therefore, it is not in the best interest of the MTA to recommend award to Siemens.

Bidder #2
WABCO Transit Division was found compliant with the specifications and the lowest bidder on items 20, 21, 24-26, 28, 38 and 39
Bidder #3
Knorr Brake Corporation in full compliance to the bid specifications, but is not the lowest bidder.

D.  
Cost/Price Analysis Explanation of Variances

The recommended bid price of $578,585 has been determined to be fair and reasonable based upon adequate price competition and selection of the lowest responsive and responsible bidders.

	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	

	 
	 

	 

	
	
	
	
	
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	
	
	
	
	
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	
	
	
	
	
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	
	
	
	
	
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Item No.
	MTA No.
	Description
	Qty
	Usage
	Unit Price
	Extension
	Unit Price
	Extension
	Unit Price
	Extension

	1
	N910700094
	Master Controller Assembly, Type XMA-224
	2
	ea
	$22,078.00
	44,156.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	2
	N910700117
	Cradle Assembly “A” Propulsion Logic
	4
	ea
	$51,711.00
	206,844.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	3
	N910700122
	Printed Circuit Board-Propulsion Field Interface
	4
	ea
	$7,308.00
	29,232.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	4
	N910700123
	Printed Circuit Board Power Supply
	8
	ea
	$8,490.00
	67,920.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	5
	N910700136
	Printed Circuit Board-Propulsion Field Interface
	4
	ea
	$7,308.00
	29,232.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	6
	N910700137
	Printed Circuit Board –No Motion Detector
	5
	ea
	$7,377.00
	36,885.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	7
	N910700140
	Panel Assembly-Interface Logic “A”
	8
	ea
	$7,894.00
	63,152.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	8
	N910700143
	Printed Circuit Board –Logic Interface
	6
	ea
	$8,892.00
	53,352.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	9
	N910700144
	Panel Assembly- Logic Interface “B”
	8
	ea
	$7,894.00
	63,152.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	10
	N910700146
	Printed Circuit Board Logic Interface
	8
	ea
	$8,892.00
	71,136.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	12
	N910700161
	Ground Brush
	200
	ea
	$69.70
	13,940.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	13
	N910700163
	Traction Motor Assembly, Type 150JB, W/O half coupling
	18
	ea
	$25,790.00
	464,220.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	14
	N910700169
	Gear Unit Assembly, Type WR-440 with half coupling
	15
	ea
	$14,957.00
	224,355.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	16
	N910700174
	Circuit Breaker Assembly-High Speed
	2
	ea
	$9,660.00
	19,320.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	17
	N910700183
	Generator Assembly, P-Signal & Brake Signal
	10
	ea
	$19,010.00
	190,100.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	18
	N910700012
	Inverter Tray Assembly
	3
	ea
	$32,716.00
	98,148.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	19
	N910700016
	Capacitor Tray Assembly
	4
	ea
	$6,345.00
	25,380.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	20
	N910300046
	Electric Coupler, Left Hand
	4
	ea
	$8,207.00
	32,828.00
	$8,165.00
	32,660.00
	no bid
	0.00

	21
	N910300068
	Electric Coupler, Right Hand
	3
	ea
	$8,207.00
	24,621.00
	$8,165.00
	24,495.00
	no bid
	0.00

	22
	N910400019
	Leaf Assembly, Door Left
	3
	ea
	$5,890.00
	17,670.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	23
	N910700035
	Heatsink Assembly, Dynamic Brake
	1
	ea
	$19,542.00
	19,542.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	24
	N910300280
	Brake, Disc Unit, Complete 3PAF
	4
	ea
	$8,373.00
	33,492.00
	$8,332.00
	33,328.00
	no bid
	0.00

	25
	N911300291
	Brake, Disc Unit, Left Hand, 3PA
	8
	ea
	$7,461.00
	59,688.00
	$7,425.00
	59,400.00
	no bid
	0.00

	26
	N911300289
	Brake, Disc Unit, Right Hand, 3PA
	8
	ea
	$7,461.00
	59,688.00
	$7,425.00
	59,400.00
	no bid
	0.00

	27
	N911300357
	Track Brake Magnet, Type GL-70S-46
	8
	ea
	$8,103.00
	64,824.00
	no bid
	0.00
	$8,550.00
	68,400.00

	28
	N911300102
	Air Compressor Unit, D-4-AS
	2
	ea
	$21,525.00
	43,050.00
	$21,425.00
	42,850.00
	no bid
	0.00

	29
	N910700120
	Printed Circuit Board, Tach Reader
	7
	ea 
	$9,373.00
	65,611.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	30
	N910700135
	Cradle Assembly Propulsion Logic “B”
	4
	ea
	$51,602.00
	206,408.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	31
	N910700149
	Installation Speed Sensor, powered axle
	27
	ea
	$901.00
	24,327.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	32
	N910700151
	Installation Speed Sensor, un-powered axle
	30
	ea
	$1,834.00
	55,020.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	35
	N910300083
	Control Box
	2
	 
	$22,120.00
	44,240.00
	$22,165.00
	44,330.00
	no bid
	0.00

	36
	N910900010
	Transformer Assembly
	2
	 
	$25,585.00
	51,170.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	37
	N911300070
	Servotrol S-1 Portion
	14
	ea
	$5,510.00
	77,140.00
	$5,540.00
	77,560.00
	no bid
	0.00

	38
	I910300015
	Electric Coupler ASM – L.H.
	7
	ea
	$7,591.00
	53,137.00
	$6,868.00
	48,076.00
	no bid
	0.00

	39
	I910300016
	Electric Coupler ASM – R.H.
	7
	ea
	$7,591.00
	53,137.00
	$6,868.00
	48,076.00
	no bid
	0.00

	40
	I910500032
	Complete Motor, DC Blower Fan
	12
	ea
	$9,849.00
	118,188.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	41
	I910500035
	Compressor Motor
	15
	ea
	$34,722.00
	520,830.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	42
	I910500037
	Motor Assembly, DC Condenser Fan
	16
	ea
	$9,616.00
	153,856.00
	no bid
	0.00
	no bid
	0.00

	 
	 
	 
	 
	Sub Total
	 
	3,478,991.00
	 
	470,175.00
	 
	68,400.00

	 
	 
	 
	 
	Sales Tax 8.25%
	 
	287,016.76
	 
	38,789.44
	 
	5,643.00

	 
	 
	 
	 
	Total Bid
	 
	3,766,007.76
	 
	508,964.44
	 
	74,043.00



Bids Out:            10/30/02    Total   14 �Bids Opened:    01/17/03    Total     3 �No Bids:          �Advertisement Date(s):   10/15/02�Newspaper:  Daily News





Siemens 





Golden West Towing Equipment Inc. 





Foothill Freightliner, Inc. 





Muncie J. Sopp + Son 
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Wabco





Knorr Brake Corp. 





Golden West Towing Equipment Inc. 





Foothill Freightliner, Inc. 





Muncie J. Sopp + Son 





























I hereby certify Siemens Transportation Systems, Inc. and WABCO Transit Division as being the lowest responsible bidders and recommend the award to them for total price, including sales tax, of $578,585.�_____________                                                  _________________________________�          Date                                                                                          Signature
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